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Being Italian and being sexy is supposed to go hand in hand, but somewhere along the line twenty-six-year-
old Angelina Rossi’s genes forgot their Italian love goddess heritage. And now everyone at her work knows
what a failure she is as a woman thanks to her ex-boyfriend and co-worker at Sunset Travel who has given
Angie the nickname of ‘Ice Princess’, claiming no man will ever thaw her.

Thirty-year-old business executive Trey Landers isn’t surprised by much his best friend and neighbor,
Angelina Rossi, throws his way. But this time she throws him one hell of a curve ball. She not only wants
him to accompany her on a business trip to Las Vegas, pretending to be her lover in front of her ex-
boyfriend, she wants Trey to give her pointers on what it takes to seduce a man.

A man of his word, Trey’s fevered kisses in front of her ex has the ass regretting his decision to break up
with Angie. Not that she’d ever consider going back to Rick. Especially after discovering true passion in
Trey’s arms. With that passion comes the realization they’re no longer pretending as the lines of their
longstanding friendship and newfound love begin to blur. If only what happened didn't have to stay in Vegas.

Or does it?
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From reader reviews:

Alan Dean:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not call for people to be aware of each info they get. How many people to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading a
book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specially this ONLY IN VEGAS book because
book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred % guarantees there is no
doubt in it everbody knows.

Randy Scott:

Would you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its protect may doesn't work
this is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside
search likes. Maybe you answer may be ONLY IN VEGAS why because the great cover that make you
consider regarding the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or
maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Jason Manuel:

With this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more valuable than other.
Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple way to have that. What you should do is just spending
your time not much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. On the list of books in the top list in
your reading list is definitely ONLY IN VEGAS. This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry
Hillsides can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking way up and review this reserve you
can get many advantages.

William Littlejohn:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. That book ONLY IN VEGAS was vibrant and of course has pictures
on there. As we know that book ONLY IN VEGAS has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until teenagers.
For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and think you are the character on there. So , not at
all of book usually are make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the best
book for you and try to like reading in which.
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