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When Bob Greene went home to central Ohio to be with his dying father, it set off a chain of events that led
him to knowing his dad in a way he never had before--thanks to a quiet man who lived just a few miles
away, a man who had changed the history of the world.

Greene's father--a soldier with an infantry division in World War II--often spoke of seeing the man around
town. All but anonymous even in his own city, carefully maintaining his privacy, this man, Greene's father
would point out to him, had "won the war." He was Paul Tibbets. At the age of twenty-nine, at the request of
his country, Tibbets assembled a secret team of 1,800 American soldiers to carry out the single most violent
act in the history of mankind. In 1945 Tibbets piloted a plane--which he called Enola Gay, after his mother--
to the Japanese city of Hiroshima, where he dropped the atomic bomb.

On the morning after the last meal he ever ate with his father, Greene went to meet Tibbets. What developed
was an unlikely friendship that allowed Greene to discover things about his father, and his father's generation
of soldiers, that he never fully understood before.

DUTY

is the story of three lives connected by history, proximity, and blood; indeed, it is many stories, intimate and
achingly personal as well as deeply historic. In one soldier's memory of a mission that transformed the
world--and in a son's last attempt to grasp his father's ingrained sense of honor and duty--lies a powerful
tribute to the ordinary heroes of an extraordinary time in American life.

What Greene came away with is found history and found poetry--a profoundly moving work that offers a
vividly new perspective on responsibility, empathy, and love. It is an exploration of and response to the
concept of duty as it once was and always should be: quiet and from the heart. On every page you can hear
the whisper of a generation and its children bidding each other farewell.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Ehlers:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. One particular activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you are ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Duty: A Father, His Son, And
The Man Who Won The War, you may enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still need to miss it?
What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout men. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on
its named reading friends.

Marlene Childs:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your short time to read it because all this time you only find e-book that need more
time to be examine. Duty: A Father, His Son, And The Man Who Won The War can be your answer because
it can be read by a person who have those short free time problems.

Edward Chavez:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. This Duty: A Father, His Son, And The Man Who Won The War
can give you a lot of good friends because by you considering this one book you have issue that they don't
and make you more like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you to get success. This
publication offer you information that might be your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than other
make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? Let's have Duty: A Father, His Son, And The Man Who
Won The War.

Marianne Stromain:

A lot of guide has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by world wide web on social
media. You can choose the very best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever simply by searching
from it. It is called of book Duty: A Father, His Son, And The Man Who Won The War. Contain your
knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make an individual
happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one destination to
other place.
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